

Office of State Procurement  
State of Louisiana  
Division of Administration

JOHN BEL EDWARDS  
GOVERNOR



JAY DARDENNE  
COMMISSIONER OF ADMINISTRATION

3/14/23

**ADDENDUM NO. 01**

Your reference is directed to RFx Number 3000020755 for the Invitation to Bid for the State of Louisiana – LDWF Boots and Waders, which is currently scheduled to open at 10:00 A.M. CT on 03/21/2023.

The following changes have been made to the referenced solicitation:

\*\*\*\*\*

The following are the Vendor's submitted questions received by the deadline date of March 7, 2023 and the State's responses are as follows:

1. **Vendor Question:** Kindly provide us with the previous Bid Tabulation.

**State's Response:** See attached Appendix A – Bid Tabulations.

2. **Vendor Question:** Please let us know the details of the vendor/ vendors for the previous contract.

**State's Response:** The vendor awarded the most recent contract is Barney's Inc.

3. **Vendor Question:** Kindly provide us Total Expenditures incurred for past contract over the last 3 years.

**State's Response:** A public records request will need to be filed in order to obtain the requested documents. The Office of General Counsel will address all public records requests for the Division of Administration. Please submit your request to [DOAPUBLICRECORDS@LA.GOV](mailto:DOAPUBLICRECORDS@LA.GOV) if you need to obtain this information.

4. **Vendor Question:** What are the preferences considered when evaluating this bid?

**State's Response:** Please see #21 in Special Terms and Conditions for Preference information.

5. **Vendor Question:** How many employees are served under this contract?

6. **Vendor Question:** What would be the ordering procedure? One time purchase or as and when needed basis? Bulk quantities or small orders?

**State's Response:** As stated in the Special Terms and Conditions, #13 Orders: "The using Agency is to issue contract purchase orders for the items required, as and when needed." These orders could be in bulk or small quantities.

7. **Vendor Question:** Will you be awarding to one vendor or multiple vendors by line item?

**State's Response:** As stated in the Special Terms and Conditions, #28 Method of Award: "It is the intent of the State to award by line item to the lowest responsive, responsible bidder meeting specifications." It is possible that multiple vendors could be awarded per line item.

8. **Vendor Question:** Is it possible to adjust prices after the initial year of the contract period?

**State's Response:** No, Price adjustments are not possible for this contract.

9. **Vendor Question:** Do we need to have a shoe mobile?

**State's Response:** No, a Shoe Mobile is not a requirement for this contract.

10. **Vendor Question:** Do we need to bid on all items in order to be responsive? Or do we have the option to bid on certain items and not others?

**State's Response:** A bidder does not need to bid on all lines to be responsive. Bidders can bid on specific items.

\*\*\*\*\*

All else remains as on original bid.

\*\*\*\*\*

**THIS ADDENDUM IS HEREBY OFFICIALLY MADE A PART OF THE REFERENCED SOLICITATION.**

**ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:** If you have already submitted your bid and this Addendum does not cause you to revise your bid, you should acknowledge receipt of this Addendum by identifying your business name and by signing where indicated. You may return this Acknowledgement by mail or by hand delivery to: Office of State Procurement: 1201 N. 3<sup>rd</sup> Street, Ste. 2-160, Baton Rouge, LA 70802, or by fax to: (225) 342-9756. The State reserves the right to request a completed Acknowledgement at any time. Failure to execute an Acknowledgement shall not relieve the bidder from complying with the terms of its bid.

Addendum Acknowledged/No changes:

For: \_\_\_\_\_ By: \_\_\_\_\_

**REVISION:** If you have already submitted your bid and this Addendum requires you to revise your bid, you must indicate any change(s) below, identify your business name and sign where shown. Revisions shall be delivered prior to bid opening by mail or by hand delivery or courier to: Office of State Procurement, 1201 N. 3<sup>rd</sup> Street, Ste. 2-160, Baton Rouge, LA 70802, and indicate the RFX number and the bid opening date and time on the outside of the envelope for proper identification, or by fax to: (225) 342-9756. Electronic transmissions other than by fax are not being accepted at this time

**Revisions received after bid opening shall not be considered and you shall be held to your original bid.**

Revision:

For: \_\_\_\_\_ By: \_\_\_\_\_

By: Tuan Nguyen  
Office of State Procurement  
Telephone No. 225-219-0245  
Email: tuan.nguyen@la.gov

Line	Item Description	Quantity	UOM	Barney's Inc			THE LIBERTY STORE			THE THOMASTON CORPORATION		
				Price	Extended Price	Brand/Model	Price	Extended Price	Brand/Model	Price	Extended Price	Brand/Model
	Brands and models listed are for comparative purposes, to show level of quality. Minor deviations from the listed specifications (dimensions, weight, etc.) will be considered.											
1	LaCrosse Men's Grange or approved equal Style 150040, Weight 4.5 lbs per pair, Height 18" Color: Green, Insulation - Non-Insulated Traction - Best for all-terrain, slip resistant Footbed: Removable Ethylene Vinyl Acetate (EVA) footbed Shank: Fiberglass Shank Sizes: 5-15 (Whole sizes only) Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 74.07	\$ 74.07	LaCrosse 150040	\$ 83.30	\$ 83.30	LaCrosse 150040	\$ 99.95	\$ 99.95	LaCrosse 150040
2	LaCrosse Women's Grange or approved equal Style 631124, Weight 3.5 lbs per pair, Height 14" Color: Black, Insulation - Non-Insulated Traction - Best for all-terrain, slip resistant Footbed: Removable EVA footbed Shank: Fiberglass Shank Sizes: 5-15 (Whole sizes only) Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 74.07	\$ 74.07	LaCrosse 631129	\$ 74.60	\$ 74.60	LaCrosse 631124	\$ 99.95	\$ 99.95	LaCrosse 631124
3	LaCrosse Big Chief Hip Boots or approved equal Style 700001, Weight 7.1 lbs, height men's 32" Color: OD Green, Insulation: 600 gram Lining - Nylon, Sizes: Men's 5-15 (Whole sizes only) Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 117.28	\$ 117.28	LaCrosse 700001	\$ 125.40	\$ 125.40	LaCrosse 700001	\$ 134.95	\$ 134.95	LaCrosse 700001
4	La Crosse Alpha Swampfox Drop Top Max-5 600G or approved equal Style 700082, Weight - 6.2 lbs, Height - Chest Insulation: 3.5mm Neoprene, 600G Thinsulated Ultra Boot Color: Brown, Camo Pattern - Realtree Max 5 Wader Upper Material - Tasslon Nylon Upper Traction - best for mud, snow; Shank: Steel, Protection - Plain Toe Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 209.88	\$ 209.88	LaCrosse 700082	\$ 224.40	\$ 224.40	LaCrosse 700082	\$ 219.95	\$ 219.95	LaCrosse 700082
5	La Crosse Mallard II Max-5 1000G Expandable or approved equal Style 700316, Weight - 10 lbs, Height - Chest Insulation: 3.5mm Neoprene, 1000G Thinsulated Ultra Boot Color: Brown, Camo Pattern - Realtree Max 5 Wader Upper Material - 3.5 mm Upper Traction - best for mud; Footbed - Removable EVA Shank: Steel, Protection - Plain Toe Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 191.36	\$ 191.36	LaCrosse 700316	\$ 204.60	\$ 204.60	LaCrosse 700316	\$ 204.95	\$ 204.95	LaCrosse 700316
6	La Crosse 4X Alpha 3MM or approved equal Style 376101, Weight - 4.8 lbs per pair, Height - 16" Insulation: 3.5mm Neoprene Color: Brown; Camo Pattern - Realtree Xtra Green Traction - best for mud, snow Footbed - Removable Polyurethane Footbed Shank: Fiberglass Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 111.11	\$ 111.11	LaCrosse 376101	\$ 118.80	\$ 118.80	LaCrosse 376101	\$ 129.95	\$ 129.95	LaCrosse 376101
7	La Crosse Alpha Lite Green or Black or approved equal Style 200062 or 200063, Weight - 4 lbs per pair, Height - 16" Insulation: 5mm Neoprene Color: Green Traction - best for mud, snow Footbed - Removable EVA Footbed Shank: None; Protection - Plain toe Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 80.25	\$ 80.25	LaCrosse 200062	\$ 92.80	\$ 92.80	LaCrosse 200062 and 200063	\$ 104.95	\$ 104.95	LaCrosse 200062
8	La Crosse 4X Alpha Snake Boot or approved equal Style 376121, Weight - 5.1 lbs per pair, Height - 16" Insulation: Non-insulated Color: Brown, Camo Pattern - Realtree Xtra Green Traction - best for mud, snow Footbed - Removable Polyurethane Footbed Shank: Fiberglass Shank; Protection - Snake Guard Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 129.63	\$ 129.63	LaCrosse 376121	\$ 138.60	\$ 138.60	LaCrosse 376121	\$ 144.95	\$ 144.95	LaCrosse 376121
9	La Crosse 4X Alpha 7MM or approved equal Style 376103, Weight - 5.2 lbs per pair, Height - 16" Insulation: 7MM Neoprene Color: Brown, Camo Pattern - Realtree Xtra Traction - best for mud, snow Footbed - Removable Polyurethane Footbed Shank: Fiberglass Shank Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 117.28	\$ 117.28	LaCrosse 376103	\$ 125.40	\$ 125.40	LaCrosse 376103	\$ 134.95	\$ 134.95	LaCrosse 376103
10	La Crosse Burlly Foam Insulated or approved equal Style 266040, Weight - 4.5 lbs per pair, Height - 18" Insulation: Foam Insulated Color: Green Traction - best for all-terrain, slip resistant Footbed - Removable EVA Footbed Shank: Fiberglass Shank; Protection - Plain toe Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 80.25	\$ 80.25	LaCrosse 266040	\$ 88.80	\$ 88.80	LaCrosse 266040	\$ 104.95	\$ 104.95	LaCrosse 266040
11	La Crosse Burlly Air Grip Foam Insulated or approved equal Style 266050, Weight - 5.3 lbs per pair, Height - 18" Insulation: Foam Insulated Color: Green Traction - best for mud, snow Footbed - Removable EVA Footbed Shank: Fiberglass Shank; Protection - Plain toe Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 82.72	\$ 82.72	LaCrosse 266050	\$ 92.40	\$ 92.40	LaCrosse 266050	\$ 106.95	\$ 106.95	LaCrosse 266050

12	La Crosse Burly Trac-Lite 800G or approved equal Style 266060, Weight - 5.5 lbs per pair, Height - 18" Insulation: 800G Thinsulate Ultra Color: Green Traction - best for mud, snow Footbed - Removable EVA Footbed Shank: Fiberglass Shank; Protection - Plain toe Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 101.23	\$ 101.23	LaCrosse 266060	\$ 108.24	\$ 108.24	LaCrosse 266060	\$ 121.95	\$ 121.95	LaCrosse 266060
13	La Crosse Burly Air Grip 800G or approved equal Style 266075, Weight - 5.5 lbs per pair, Height - 18" Insulation: 800G Thinsulate Ultra Color: Green Traction - best for mud, snow Footbed - Removable EVA Footbed Shank: Fiberglass Shank; Protection - Plain toe Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 101.23	\$ 101.23	LaCrosse 266075	\$ 108.24	\$ 108.24	LaCrosse 266075	\$ 121.95	\$ 121.95	LaCrosse 266075
14	La Crosse Big Chief Uninsulated hip boots or approved equal Style 154040, Weight - 7 lbs per pair, Height - 32" Insulation: Non-insulated Color: Green Traction - Best for all-terrain, slip resistant Footbed - Removable EVA Footbed Shank: Fiberglass Shank; Protection - Plain toe Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 111.11	\$ 111.11	LaCrosse 154040	\$ 122.80	\$ 122.80	LaCrosse 154040	\$ 129.95	\$ 129.95	LaCrosse 154040
15	La Crosse Marsh 32" OD Green or approved equal Style 156040, Weight - 7 lbs per pair, Height - 32" Insulation: Non-insulated Color: Green Traction - Best for all-terrain, slip resistant Footbed - Removable EVA Footbed Shank: Fiberglass Shank; Protection - Plain toe Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 111.11	\$ 111.11	LaCrosse 156040	\$ 122.80	\$ 122.80	LaCrosse 156040	\$ 129.95	\$ 129.95	LaCrosse 156040
16	Men's Premium Knee Boots-18" - Steel Toe - Non-Insulated Brand: LaCrosse, Model# 267220 or approved equal Color: Black Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 75.31	\$ 75.31	LaCrosse 267220	\$ 88.80	\$ 88.80	LaCrosse 267220	\$ 100.95	\$ 100.95	LaCrosse 267220
17	Men's Short ZXT Irrigation Hip Boots-26" - Non-Insulated Brand: LaCrosse, Model# 267260 or approved equal Color: Standard Green Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 97.53	\$ 97.53	LaCrosse 267260	\$ 108.80	\$ 108.80	LaCrosse 267260	\$ 118.95	\$ 118.95	LaCrosse 267260
18	Men's Bootfoot Cleated Chest Waders - Non-Insulated Brand: Hodgman Mackenzie, Model #IK-832788 or approved equal Color: Brown Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
19	Men's Breathable Bootfoot Chest Fishing Waders - Non-Insulated Brand: Caddis, Model# IK-833085 or approved equal Color: Tan Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
20	Men's Roper Boot Regular and Wide Widths Brand: Ariat, Model # 10002280 or approved equal Color: Black Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
21	Unisex Waterproof Tactical 8" Boot, Regular and Wide Widths Brand: 5.11 Unisex, Model # 12312 or approved equal Color: Black Merrell MOAB 2, 8" Tactical Response Waterproof Boot, ITEM#J45335 & J45335W Sizes: 7-15 & 7-14 Wide Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 118.37	\$ 118.37	5.11 12312	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
22	First Tactical Men's Urban Operator H2O or approved equal Style: 165015 Full Grain polishable leather toe, 100% Waterproof and breathable membrane YKK side zipper Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	\$ 124.06	\$ 124.06	First Tactical 165015	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
23	Muck Men's Fieldblazer Classic Tall or approved equal Style: FBC-MOCT Base: SMM Neoprene Lining: Breathable Airmesh, Toe to Heel Reinforcement, Easy to Clean Rubber Overlay, Durable Quick Cleaning Sole Sizes: Men's 5 - 15 Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	87.65 92.59	87.65 92.59	Rocky RKV5053	\$ 102.30	\$ 102.30	Muck Men's Fieldblazer FBC- MOCT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
24	Royal White Shrimp Boot PVC Gum Sole or approved equal Height - 12" Insulated - Non-Insulated Color: White, Black Traction - Non-skid gum sole Sizes: All available sizes, men and women, as applicable Specify Sizes Available: _____ Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
25	Frogg Togg Cascades 2-Ply Rubber Cleated Bootfoot or approved equal Style 2716243 2-ply rubberized 300 denier polyester upper and FT-lite vulcanized rubber, Improved cleated soles Adjustable webbing belt leash with quick-release buckle Durable rubber boots with steel shanks Comfort fit, angled leg opening Sizes: Men's 7 - 14 (whole sizes only) Specify Brand/Model: _____	1	Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID